
Deloitte 

Deloitte had the largest number of clients among FTSE 250 firms in the UK in 2022. 
According to reports, it also had the highest market share in auditing among India's top 
500 corporations in 2023. The company has been ranked first by market share in 
consulting for the fourth consecutive year by Gartner. Kennedy Consulting Research 
and Advisory puts Deloitte first in global consulting and management consulting based 
on aggregate revenue. 

Deloitte Interview Questions 

1. What is the difference between stored and trigger procedures? 

Here are some essential differences between triggers and SQL-stored procedures: 

1. When you make a trigger, you must choose an event and an action that will happen when the 

trigger is run. Stored procedures are just SQL statements that don't need an event or action. 

Stored procedures can be called directly from an application, SQL commands, or stored 

procedures. 

2. When the event happens, the trigger runs on its own. A stored procedure can be run by hand 

or by an application that calls it. 

3. You can call a stored procedure from inside a trigger, but you can't call a trigger from inside a 

stored procedure. 

4. A trigger runs automatically, while a stored procedure runs when another block makes a 

procedure call. 

5. The front end can invoke a stored procedure but not a trigger. 

6. An input parameter can be given to a stored procedure but can't be given to a trigger. 

2. What is back propagation? 

Back propagation is a common way for an artificial neural network to figure out the gradient of 

the loss function for the weights. It is often used as part of algorithms that change the 

consequences to improve the performance of a network. 

3. What is the difference between a crossover and a straight-through? 



Straight through: 

 Between a modem and a computer, switch, or router 

 Connecting a computer to a switch 

 Connecting a router to a hub 

 CAT6/CAT5 peripheral extenders 

Cross over: 

 Between two networking devices 

 Between two PCs 

 The connection between hubs 

 The connection between switches 

 Connecting a router to a computer 

4. What is SMTP? 

SMTP (Simple Mail Transfer Protocol) deals with internet mail and offers important mail 

delivery services on the IP/TCP protocol stack. Most email solutions which send emails on the 

internet use SMTP to send messages from one server to another. The messages can be retrieved 

with an email client through IMAP or POP. 

5. What is clustering support? 

As the first step in machine learning, we often group examples to learn about a subject (a data 

set). Clustering is the process of grouping examples without labels. 

List the differences between CSMA/CD (Carrier Sense Multiple Access / Collision Detection) 

and CSMA/CA (Carrier Sense Multiple Access / Collision Avoidance) in Computer Networks. 

6. What is the role of IEEE in computer networking? 

The IEEE standards for computer networks ensure that different devices can talk to each other 

and work well together. They also ensure that the network service, such as the Internet and 

related technologies, follows a set of rules and best practices so that all the networking devices 

can talk to each other and work well together. 



Since different kinds of companies make computer systems, the IEEE's computer society started 

Project 802 in 1985 to make it easier for different devices to talk to each other. 

Common Deloitte Interview Questions 

We've compiled a list of the seven most frequent Deloitte interview questions, sample 
responses and precise advice on how to put your best foot forward and showcase your 
most desirable talents and abilities to help you move one step closer to landing your 
ideal job at Deloitte. Reviewing some of the most popular interview questions asked by 
Deloitte hiring managers can help you prepare and enter the interview with a clear head 
and a well-thought-out plan of what to say. Setting yourself up for success and getting 
ready for your job interview may be as simple as conducting a practice interview with 
these commonly asked questions before the big day. 

The following are the seven most commonly asked Deloitte interview questions and 
answers: 

1. What made you apply for a position at Deloitte? 

Hiring managers across every organization ask this question to measure your interest 
and learn more about the organization you're applying to. Deloitte is no exception. 

How to Answer: Prepare for this question by researching Deloitte ahead of time and 
becoming familiar with its culture, mission, as well as professional principles. Try to 
highlight your expertise and at least one factor that drew you to the company in your 
response. 

Example Answer: As an experienced financial analyst, I'm dedicated to providing the 
best possible service to my clients and the knowledge they need to make informed 
financial decisions. I've been looking for a way to make a bigger difference in my 
community, and this position appealed to me because your company is known for its 
apparent market success, rapid expansion, and inclusive work atmosphere. 

2. What do you know about Deloitte? 

This question, or something similar, will very certainly be asked throughout the interview 
process at Deloitte, regardless of the position you're looking for. 



How to Answer: Prepare for your interview by researching and having a few significant 
and relevant facts about Deloitte on hand. As a general rule, know everything there is to 
know about the company, including what they specialize in, where they are 
headquartered, and when they were created. 

Example Answer: Throughout my undergraduate education, I constantly followed 
Deloitte's work and was intrigued by the firm's recent development, particularly the 
acquisition of Terbium Labs. Since its founding in London in 1845, Deloitte has 
developed tremendously. One of the Big Four, Deloitte is regarded as one of the largest 
privately held professional services firms. 

I am confident in my ability to assist Deloitte in continuing to expand and better the lives 
of millions of people around the world. 

3. How did you get into the field of accounting? 

If you're interviewing with Deloitte, you're probably in the accounting sector. This is a 
common question asked by Deloitte hiring managers to determine your professional 
interests. 

How to Answer: This popular Deloitte interview question can be answered by recalling 
the specific aspects of accounting that drew you to the area and highlighting your 
devotion to the job. 

Example Answer: Accounting gives me enormous pleasure. I enjoy my job because it 
both challenges and fulfills me while also allowing me to serve individuals from all walks 
of life. My early interest in financial data analysis and calculating metrics drove me to 
the field. 

4. Tell me about a point in your career where you used negotiation skills to 
change the outcome of something. 

During Deloitte job interviews, this is one of the most often asked questions. If you want 
to work for Deloitte, you'll require exceptional negotiation and communication abilities, 
regardless of department or function. 

How to Answer: Try to recall a time when you utilized your negotiating abilities to close 
a sale, explain a complex concept to a client, or influence the outcome of a team 
meeting. You should attempt to demonstrate excellent communication and interpersonal 
skills in your response. 



Example Answer: At Ernst & Young, I used my negotiating talents to persuade a 
customer not to seek financial assistance from a competitive firm. After listening to the 
customers' concerns, I addressed them directly. I met with their Chief Financial Officer 
extensively, resulting in negotiating a new consulting agreement that was more suited to 
the company's needs. In my experience, clear and powerful communication is crucial in 
each negotiation. 

5. How do you manage multiple deadlines and tasks? 

Working quickly and achieving deadlines are critical to employee success at Deloitte. Passionate, 

focused, and efficient employees are significantly more appealing to hiring managers. 

How to Answer: You should emphasize your time management and organization skills in this 

response. 

Example Answer: With more than three years of professional auditing experience, I've honed my 

time management skills and can easily stay on target while managing many assignments and 

deadlines on any given day. To meet deadlines and accomplish all activities promptly, I prioritize 

and plan tasks, set goals, delegate when appropriate, and keep clear communication with my 

team. 

6. How do you stay focused when performing audits and other tax and legal services?  

Working with numbers might become tedious at times, but remaining focused is crucial if you 

want to work with Deloitte. Hiring managers frequently ask this question to assess your ability to 

complete tasks and remain focused on the job. 

How to Answer: When providing audits and legal services, expressing your capacity to be 

methodical and paying close attention to detail is a wonderful approach to responding. 

Example Answer: Auditing and reviewing figures are two things I enjoy doing. I am hyper-

aware of the task at hand at all times, paying close attention to detail and scrutinizing data for 

any fraud, infractions, or abnormalities. I tackle all audits and financial assessments analytically 

and rigorously to keep focused. 

7. What can you bring to Deloitte? 

During job interviews, Deloitte recruiting managers frequently ask this question to further 

analyze potential workers' talents and competencies. 



How to Answer: This is an excellent opportunity to showcase your finest abilities. Answer this 

question by mentioning any relevant work experience you have and emphasizing your best 

professional qualities. 

Example Answer: I am convinced that with over five years of auditing and tax experience, I can 

help Deloitte expand and broaden its client base while continuing to provide the high-quality 

financial services that Deloitte customers expect.  

When auditing limited companies, huge organizations, and small firms, I have a keen eye for 

detail, a vested interest in the financial system, and a demonstrated track record of providing 

remarkable outcomes. 

Deloitte Technical Interview Questions 

1. What do you mean by tunnel mode? 

Tunnel Mode Tunnel Mode is a way to send encrypted data over the Internet. Both the data and 

the original IP address are encrypted. The Encapsulating Security Payload (ESP) works in both 

Tunnel Mode and Transport Mode. 

2. What is C programming language? 

C is a popular, easy-to-use, and flexible programming language that can be used for many 

different things. It is a structured, machine-independent programming language used extensively 

to write applications, operating systems like Windows, and other complex programmes like the 

Oracle database, Git, Python interpreter, and more. 

People say that "C" is the programming language of gods. C is the foundation of programming. 

If you know "C," it's easy to learn other programming languages that use the same ideas as "C." 

3. What is the difference between C and Java? 

C is an Object-Oriented Programming Language, while Java is a Procedural Programming 

Language. Java is a high-level language, and C is a middle-level language. 

4. What is polymorphism in programming? 



In programming languages and type theory, polymorphism is when things of different types 

share a single interface, or a single symbol can stand for more than one type. 

Object-oriented programming can't work without polymorphism (OOP). Classes describe what 

an object is. They have the potential to get new properties and methods. We could, for example, 

make an object with the class Car. This car might have been: 

 Things like colour, make, model, and speed at the moment 

 Methods are functions that the class calls, like "go," "park," "stop," "turn right," "turn left," 

and so on. 

5. How can you create and use threads in Java? 

One way to describe thread is as a light process. Thread uses fewer resources to create itself and 

stay alive because it shares the process's resources. Java's main thread is the one that starts when 

the programme does. Because of the main thread, the slave thread is made. This is the last thread 

that needs to finish running. 

6. What is the difference between char and varchar in DBMS? 

Even though both char and varchar are character data fields, char is a data field with a fixed 

length, and varchar is a data field with a variable size. 

 Char can only store non-Unicode strings of a fixed size, but varchar can store strings of 

different sizes. 

 For data that changes a lot, Char is better than varchar. This is because a row of data with a 

fixed length doesn't tend to break up. 

 Char will only take up the fixed amount of space set when the variable is declared. But 

varchar will take up as much space as the data it contains, plus 1 or 2 bytes for the length 

prefix. 

 If the data is less than 255 characters, only one byte is set aside, but if it is more than 255 

characters, two bytes are set aside. If we use a char to store a 'Y' or 'N' flag, it will take one 

byte, but if we use varchar, it will take two bytes, plus an extra byte for the length prefix, to 

store the flag. 

7. What is an implicit cursor? 



The implicit cursor is a cursor that the Oracle server has made and is in charge of. The 
implicit cursor is always used to process the selected statements internally. The implicit 
internal cursor runs in the background when you run a select statement. 

8. What is a proxy server? 

A proxy server is a computer system or router lets users connect to the internet. So, it 
makes it harder for hackers to get into a private network. It is a server called an 
"intermediary" because it sits between end users and the websites they visit online. 

A computer uses an IP address to connect to the internet. This is like the street address 
of your home. It tells incoming data where to go and gives outgoing data a return 
address so other devices can verify it. A proxy server is a computer connected to the 
internet and has its IP address. 

9. What do you know about machine learning? 

Machine learning is a branch of artificial intelligence (AI) and computer science that tries 
to mimic how humans learn using data and algorithms. Over time, it gets better and 
better at doing this. 

Machine learning is an integral part of data science, which is constantly growing. 
Statistical methods teach algorithms to classify or make predictions and find critical 
insights in data mining projects. From then, applications and organizations may use 
these data to inform decisions that should have a positive impact on key growth 
indicators. As big data keeps growing and getting bigger, the market will need more 
data scientists. They will have to help figure out the most important business questions 
and what data is required to answer them. 

10. Can you explain function overloading? 

Object-oriented programming lets two or more functions with the same name, but 
different parameters work together. This is called function overloading. Function 
Overloading is when a function name is used for too many other tasks. In Function 
Overloading, the "Function" name should be the same, but the arguments should differ. 

11. What do you know about the Python language? 

Python is a high-level programming language that is interpreted, object-oriented, and 
has dynamic semantics. Its high-level data structures and dynamic typing and binding 
make it a good choice for Rapid Application Development and for use as a scripting or 



glue language to connect existing components. Python's syntax is simple and easy to 
learn. It emphasizes being easy to read, which lowers the cost of maintaining 
programmers. Python supports modules and packages, which makes it easier to break 
up programmers into smaller parts and reuse code. Free source and binary distributions 
of the Python interpreter and the entire standard library are available for all popular 
platforms. They can also be shared freely. 

12. What do you understand about tunneling protocol in Computer Networks? 

Tunnelling is a way to connect networks of the same type from the source to the 
destination through a network of a different kind. 

In this case, the packet from one network gets to the other through a different type of 
network that links the two. 

13. What are the pros and cons of star topology in Computer Networks? 

Advantages of Star Topology is: 

 Adding more computers to a star topology network doesn't cause any problems. 

 In a star topology, it's easy to find and fix broken parts. 

 In a star topology, if a cable breaks, it will only affect one workstation. 

 Star topology is more accessible than bus topology or ring topology. 

 In a star topology, if one node has a problem, it won't affect the other nodes. 

 It can grow and change more than a peer-to-peer or ring network. 

 In star topology, adding or removing nodes from the central hub is easy without 
affecting the other nodes. 

 It's easy to set up and keep up. 

Cons of Star Topology:  

 More cables are needed to connect networks. 

 In a star topology, the cost of concentrators or hubs is very high. 

 There aren't many routes in the star topology. 

 If the hub breaks, the whole network falls apart. 



 The star topology cost is higher than other topologies because it needs more 
network. 

14. Discuss the physical layer of the OSI (Open Systems Interconnection) 
Model in the context of Computer Networks. 

The Open System Interconnection (OSI) Model, a physical and electrical representation 
of the system, start with the Physical Layer. It is made up of different network parts like 
power plugs, connectors, receivers, different types of cables, and so on. The Physical 
Layer moves bits of information from one device (like a computer) to another (s). 

15. Differentiate between hierarchical database models and networks in 
DBMS. 

Hierarchical Data Model: 

This type of data model has been around for the longest. In 1968, IBM came up with it. 
It puts data into a structure that looks like a tree. The following are parts of the 
hierarchical model: 

 It has nodes and branches that connect them. 

 The root node is the node at the very top. 

 If there is more than one node at the top level, they are called root segments. 

 There is only one parent for each node.  

 A parent can have many children. 

The Network Data Model is the next step from the Hierarchical Data Model. Instead of a 
tree structure, it uses directed graphs to organise data. A child can have more than one 
parent in this situation. It uses the idea of Records and Sets, two data structures. 

16. Explain the DDL (Data Definition Language), DML (Data Manipulation 
Language) and DCL (Data Control Language) statements in SQL. 

 Code the data structures using the Data Definition Language (DDL). 

 Data Manipulation Language (DML): Use these structures to store and play with 
data. 

 Data Control Language (DCL): Choose who can change the structure and the data. 



17. What is a Kernel in OS? 

Kernel is the central part of an operating system that controls how the computer and its 
hardware work. It contains how memory and CPU time is used. It is an essential part of 
an operating system. The kernel acts as a link between programmes and the data 
processing that happens at the hardware level. 
 
This is done through inter-process communication and system calls. 

Kernel is the first part of an operating system to load into memory. It stays there until the 
operating system is shut down. It is in charge of managing discs, tasks, and memory. 

It decides which process should be given to the processor and which should stay in the 
main memory. It acts as a bridge between the user's programmes and the hardware. 
Kernel's main job is to manage how software (like user-level apps) and hardware (like 
the CPU and disc memory) talk to each other 

18. What are the advantages and disadvantages of using threads in context to the OS? 

Threads have these benefits: 

1. Running input, calculations, and output as three separate threads may improve the 

performance of an app that does all three. One of the other threads can do calculations while 

the input or output thread waits for a connection. A multithreaded programme is also a good 

choice for a server app that handles multiple network connections. 

2. Now that most desktop and laptop computers have CPUs with multiple cores, using multiple 

threads within a process can help a single process make better use of the hardware resources 

available if the application is correct. 

In general, switching between threads is much less work for the operating system than switching 

between processes. So, multiple threads use fewer resources than various processes, and it is 

easier to run programmes that logically need to run on many threads on systems with only one 

processor. Still, it's important to remember that writing a multithreaded programme is 

problematic because it takes time to design. 

Bad things about Threads: 

1. Designing programmes with multiple threads take a lot of care. In a multithreaded 

programme, it is easy for minor timing errors or errors caused by the unintentional sharing of 

variables to happen. Alan Cox, a well-known Linux expert, has said that threads are also 

known as "how to shoot yourself in both feet at the same time." 



2. Debugging a programme with multiple threads is a lot harder than debugging a programme 

with only one thread because it's hard to track how the threads interact. 

19. How does reference counting deal with objects that are memory allocated in 

context to OS? When doesn't it get things back? 

Reference counting is also one of the simplest ways to eliminate garbage. It also lets you take 

care of resources that aren't in memory, like operating system objects, which are often much 

more challenging to find than memory. 

Why is it that a single serial port is controlled by a single interrupt-driven I/O (input/ output), but 

a front-end processor, such as a terminal concentrator, is managed by a polling I/O? Answer this 

question in light of OS. 

Polling can be faster than I/O, which is driven by interrupts. When the I/O is short and happens 

often, this is the case. Even though a single serial port doesn't do I/O very often and should 

therefore use interrupts, a group of serial ports, like those in a terminal concentrator, can do a lot 

of short I/O operations, and interrupting for each one would put a lot of stress on the system. The 

load could be reduced with a well-timed polling loop that does not waste resources by repeatedly 

iterating when no I/O is required. 

19. Explain transaction atomicity in context to OS 

What makes a transaction atomic is determined by its context or the environment in which it is 

being used. For example, in an online airline booking system, a booking may be made up of two 

separate actions that make a transaction: paying for the seat and reserving the seat for the 

customer who just paid. Business logic says that these two actions, even though they are 

different, must happen at the same time. Having one without the other can cause problems. For 

example, the system might let two different people reserve the same seat. 

20. What is the difference between a declaration and a definition for a variable or a 

function in C? 

When you declare a variable, you tell the compiler its name, what kind of value it holds, and, if it 

has one, its initial value. In other words, the declaration gives information about how a variable 

works. Whereas "Definition of a variable" says where the variable is stored. In other words, 

when the variable is defined, space is set aside for it. In the C programming language, defining 

and declaring a variable happens at the same time. In other words, there's no difference between 

saying something and defining it. 

21. What are the different storage classes in C? 



Auto: This is the default storage class for all variables declared inside a function or block. So, the 

word "auto" is rarely used when writing C language programmes. Auto variables can only be 

used inside the block or function where they have been declared (which defines their scope). 

Extern: Extern storage class tells us that the variable is defined somewhere else and not in the 

same block where it is used. The value is given to it in a different block, and that block can also 

change or overwrite it. 

Static: This storage class is used to declare static variables, often used when writing C language 

programmes. Static variables keep their value even after they are no longer in use. 

Register: This storage class sets up variables called register that work the same way as auto 

variables. The only difference is that if a free registration is available, the compiler tries to store 

these variables in the microprocessor's register. 

22. What is generational garbage collection in the context of Java? What makes it so 

popular? 

Java's automatic memory management is done through "garbage collection." Java programmes 

are turned into bytecode, which can be run on a Java Virtual Machine (JVM). When Java 

programmes run on the JVM, objects are made on the heap, a section of memory set aside for the 

programme. Some things will become useless in the long run. The garbage collector looks for 

these objects that aren't being used and delete them to make room in memory. 

23. What are access specifiers in C++? 

Access modifiers, another name for access specifiers, are used to implement essential parts of 

object-oriented programming called "Data Hiding." 

They are used in a class to set how class members can be accessed. But it limits the class 

members, so they can't be directly accessed outside the class. 

Interview Process at Deloitte 

It takes professionalism, precision, and tremendous competence to get a job at Deloitte. 
Knowing what to expect and thoroughly preparing for your job interview will help you 
come across as a knowledgeable, composed, and capable candidate and prepare you 
how to give your best in an interview with globally reputed organizations.  



The following is a general outline of what to expect at your Deloitte job interview: 

 First Interview 

You will be contacted for an interview if the hiring managers at Deloitte are impressed 
with your application. Within one to three months, you should receive an email or phone 
call from them. The initial round of interviews may be held in person, over the phone, or 
over Skype or video conference, depending on the position you're looking for and the 
location of the employment. The initial interview for a position at Deloitte is usually 
conducted by a human resources professional and comprises basic interview questions, 
such as critical thinking and resume-based questions, regardless of the role. 

A short JAM, or Just A Minute round, is sometimes included in Deloitte's first round of 
interviews, where a job applicant is assigned subjects to speak on for one minute. 

 Second Interview 

If you aced your first Deloitte interview, your work isn't done yet. Deloitte requires most 
new workers to go through two to three rounds of interviews before getting hired. If your 
first interview was conducted in person, the second interview can be completed shortly 
after the first. Deloitte is recognized for conducting in-depth interviews with job seekers, 
frequently asking applicants to go to one of their over 700 global offices for a full day of 
interviews. 

Deloitte's second job interview usually lasts about 30 minutes and includes behavioral 
and situational interview questions. In case you're seeking a job for a highly specialized 
or technical position, such as an engineer or programmer, the interview is frequently 
conducted by a senior manager and contains a slew of situational interview questions. 

 Third Interview 

Finally, if you're seeking a senior or highly technical position inside the company, you'll 
very certainly be forced to go through another round of questioning with senior 
management, partner, department director, or possibly a panel of interviewers after the 
second interview. 

Only the most eligible individuals are invited to the third interview. During the third 
interview, it's very important to put your best foot forward because every word will be 
scrutinized and evaluated. The third interview, like the second, usually includes 
additional situational and job-specific interview questions. 



 Pre-Employment Aptitude Testing 

You may be requested to do an aptitude test to further analyze your skills to perform the 
work, depending on the exact post you're applying for, your skill level, and your 
professional experience. A quantitative, logical, and verbal reasoning section is usually 
included in the Deloitte pre-employment aptitude test to assess your talents. 

The test may be more involved for specific professions, such as audit associate or 
computer programmer, requiring applicants to complete a mock audit, answer more 
math questions, or build a java algorithm. 

Frequently Asked Questions 

1. Are Deloitte interviews hard? 

It makes no difference if the Deloitte interview is difficult or simple. The truth is that the 
more you prepare for the interview, the more likely you are to succeed. Study rounds, 
questions, stages, etc. Understand the role completely, including what they expect from 
you, the skill sets you'll require, and the credentials you'll need. 

2. Where do you see yourself in 5 years? 

Tell them you want to learn and master a particular technology. You must persuade 
them that you intend to stay with the company for a longer period. You can say you 
want to improve your skills, gain more confidence, and keep your job in their company, 
and within the next five years, you want to be acknowledged as an authority in that field. 
You can become a seasoned specialist if given the opportunity. The recruiter is just 
interested in finding out how long you plan to stay with the company and how satisfied 
you are with your current position. 

3. What is your salary expectation? 

This is a challenging one. You can choose to quote the exact amount or not, but you 
must advise them of the percentage increase you are considering. Instead of requesting 
a certain wage, demonstrate your commitment to the position. 

4. What is the starting salary for a fresher in Deloitte? 



Deloitte's starting salary for fresher’s is roughly 4.5 lakhs per year. 

5. Why should we hire you? 

The interviewer is working to identify whether you would be a good fit for their 
organization. As a result, you will need to persuade them. You can say something like, 
"I can grab information quickly". You can discuss your abilities, skills, and past 
experiences in this section, as well as how you can bring something fresh to the role. 

6. What are your strengths and weaknesses? 

You can address your strengths by elaborating on the following points: 

 Goal-oriented and versatile 

 Ability to handle pressure 

 Strong communication skills 

The following are the weaknesses which you can address: 

 Self-critical 

 Multi-tasker 

7. How do you handle stress or tight deadlines? 

Employers are searching for examples of how stressful situations motivate you or how 
you may prevent stressful situations by planning and communicating effectively. To 
demonstrate your capacity to operate under pressure, give an example of how you 
coped with a difficult situation at your previous workplace. 

 

 


